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 FlexVision™ U-500 Features

» 6.9 Fr distal tip provides non-invasive 
 access.

» 3.6 Fr working channel for optimal 
 treatment and fluid management.

» 275° tight radius deflection.

» Increased fiber optics for high 
 resolution.

» Reinforced proximal end for axial 
 stability and greater surgeon control.

Sophistication

Superior resolution, deflection, and 
durability unite in the Stryker Flexible 
Ureteroscope to provide outstanding 
visualization and lasting workability.  
Applying the precision of increased fiber 
optic bundles, the FlexVision™ U-500 is 
the market frontrunner in resolution.  
The latest in flexible optics technology 
offers surgeons a powerful method to 
access and visualize the entire kidney, 
especially the lower pole.     

Merging the matchless clarity of the 
FlexVision™ U-500 with the standard-
setting Stryker High Definition camera 
will provide an unrivaled visual image in 
the operating room.  Urologists will find 
the Stryker Flexible Ureteroscope an 
exceptional tool by which to raise the bar 
in their procedures. 

Matchless Clarity

Detailed brightness in the smallest 
spaces enhances visibility and increases 
performance during procedures.  By 
joining the forces of the FlexVision™ 
U-500 with the Stryker Camera System, 
a surgeon is equipped with the finest 
tools available to complete complex 
operations.  

Superior Deflection

Optimal accessibility is provided in both 
kidneys through primary and secondary 
deflection to both sides.  Kidney 
treatment is made possible by way of 
dual deflection with a tight radius, 
allowing an excellent view of the upper 
and lower poles. 
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 Ordering Information

 

 FlexVision™ U-500
 503-888-000

 The following products are included:
 
 Cleaning Brush
 503-888-003
 
 Lens Cleaner
 503-888-004

 Leak Tester
 503-888-005

 Port Seal Valve (1 pkg/5)
 503-888-001

 Shipping Case
 1000-000-079
 

 Optional Accessories
 
 Sterilization/Storage Tray
 233-032-800
 
 
 
 Baskets
 
 Stryker also provides a complete line of 
 Disposable Baskets.  Please contact your local 
 Stryker Representative for selection and pricing.
 

Intuitive Design

The lightweight and ergonomic form of 
the FlexVision™ U-500 makes ureteros-
copies simpler and more comfortable.  
Combining smooth deflection buttons 
with a sleek handle offers a firm, 
dependable grip during procedures.  
During secondary deflection, a locking 
mechanism allows the hand to rest while 
accessing the lower pole.
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